

DEFIANCE COUNTY ENGINEER
BID TABULATION - 2016 BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

BID DATE: FEBRUARY 29, 2016 @ 10:00 A.M.

GRADE		QTY. Gal	ASPHALT MAT. OREGON, OH UNIT PRICE PICK-UP	ASPHALT MAT. OREGON, OH UNIT PRICE DELIVERED	K-TECH ASHLEY, IN UNIT PRICE PICK-UP	K-TECH ASHLEY, IN UNIT PRICE DELIVERED	WRIGHT ASPHALT OREGON, OH UNIT PRICE PICK-UP	WRIGHT ASPHALT OREGON, OH UNIT PRICE DELIVERED
MWS 90	ODOT 702	275,000	<u>\$1.2900</u>	<u>\$1.3676</u>	<u>\$1.3473</u>	<u>\$1.4373</u>	NO BID	NO BID
MC 30	ODOT 702	10,000	<u>\$2.6900</u>	<u>\$2.7676</u>	<u>\$2.0100</u>	<u>\$2.1000</u>	NO BID	NO BID
RS 2		10,000	<u>\$1.2900</u>	<u>\$1.3676</u>	<u>\$1.3473</u>	<u>\$1.4373</u>	NO BID	NO BID
RS 2P		10,000	<u>\$1.4000</u>	<u>\$1.4776</u>	<u>\$1.4783</u>	<u>\$1.5683</u>	NO BID	NO BID
AEP Prime		20,000	<u>\$1.6000</u>	<u>\$1.6776</u>	<u>\$1.5900</u>	<u>\$1.6800</u>	NO BID	NO BID
SS1H-DILUTED		10,000	<u>\$1.0900</u>	<u>\$1.1676</u>	<u>\$1.2200</u>	<u>\$1.3100</u>	NO BID	NO BID
HFRS2P		50,000	<u>\$1.4000</u>	<u>\$1.4776</u>	<u>\$1.4783</u>	<u>\$1.5683</u>	NO BID	NO BID
Other (State)								
CM-90			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
CM-150			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
CM-300			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
CRPE (FOG SEAL)			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
AE-NT			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>\$2.0000</u>	<u>\$2.0900</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
FOG SEAL			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>\$1.2000</u>	<u>\$1.2900</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
CRS-TR			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
QF-40			<u>\$1.1900</u>	<u>\$1.2676</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
TRMSS Non Diluted			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>\$1.7500</u>	<u>\$1.9500</u>
BM-90			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>\$2.3700</u>	<u>\$2.4600</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
CRS-2TR			<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>\$1.7500</u>	<u>\$1.9500</u>