

DEFIANCE COUNTY ENGINEER
BID TABULATION - 2016 CRUSHED AGGREGATE
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 29, 2016 @ 10:00 A.M.

ODOT SPEC.	Size No. or Type	Custar Stone Co.	Stoneco, Inc Scott Quarry	Stonco, Inc. Auglaize Quarry	Stafford Gravel, Inc	Hanson Aggregate
		Unit Price (\$/Ton)	Unit Price (\$/Ton)	Unit Price (\$/Ton)	Unit Price (\$/Ton)	Unit Price (\$/Ton)
703	1	\$11.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00
703	2	\$11.75	NO BID	\$9.75	NO BID	\$10.00
703	4	\$11.75	NO BID	\$9.75	NO BID	\$11.00
703	6	\$12.25	NO BID	\$12.00	NO BID	\$11.50
703	57	\$12.25	NO BID	\$12.00	\$15.15	\$11.50
703	67	\$12.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
703	8	\$12.50	\$10.50	\$12.00	NO BID	\$12.60
703	8 (washed)	\$13.00	\$10.50	\$12.00	\$15.15	NO BID
703	Modified 8A*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
703	89	\$12.50	NO BID	\$12.25	NO BID	\$11.50
703	9	\$12.00	NO BID	\$12.50	NO BID	\$11.00
703	9 (washed)	\$12.50	NO BID	\$12.50	\$15.15	NO BID
703	Modified 9A*	NO BID	\$10.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
703	10	\$8.65	NO BID	\$8.75	NO BID	NO BID
304	-	\$9.15	NO BID	\$8.75	\$13.50	\$8.90
410	A	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.75	NO BID	NO BID
411	-	\$9.00	NO BID	\$8.75	\$13.50	\$8.90
601	A	\$20.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
601	B	\$20.25	NO BID	\$19.00	NO BID	NO BID
601	C	\$19.25	NO BID	\$19.00	NO BID	\$18.00
601	D	\$17.25	NO BID	\$16.00	NO BID	\$16.50
310.02	ODOT Spec 1993 Type A Granular	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.00	NO BID	NO BID
703.16	Embankment	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.00	NO BID
703.02	Ice Control Sand	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.00	NO BID
703.11	Type 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.95	NO BID
703	8 (washed gravel)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.00	NO BID
703	9 (washed gravel)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.00	NO BID
703	57 (washed gravel)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.50	NO BID